
Canadian Methadone Survey 
Survey about Methadone take-home/carries doses during the COVID-19 era. 
 
Please circle or check off answers.  
 

• Are multiple choice answers.  
 

 Check box answers. 
 
How old are you? 
 

• 18-24 

• 25-30 

• 31-35 

• 36-40 

• 41-45 

• 46-50 

• 51+ 
 
What is your current gender identity? 
 

• Male 

• Female 

• Trans-Man 

• Trans-Female 

• Agender 

• Non-Binary 

• Other: 
 
Which of the following best describes your ethnicity? (Check all that apply) 
 

 Caucasian (White)  
 African Canadian (Black) 
 Asian Canadian 
 First Nations 
 Inuit 



 Metis 
 Other: 

 
How much a month do you pay out of pocket for your Methadone?  
(< is less than) 
 

• $0 

• $0 < $20 

• $21 - $40 

• $41 - $60 

• $61 - $80 

• $81 - $100 

• $101 - $200 

• $200+  
 
Where do you get your methadone dose? 
 

• Opioid Agonist Therapy Clinic 

• Pharmacy 

• Shelter 

• Delivered 

• Other: 
 
What province/territory is your methadone provider located in? 
 

• British Columbia 

• Alberta 

• Saskatchewan 

• Manitoba 

• Ontario 

• Quebec 

• New Brunswick 

• Nova Scotia 

• Prince Edward Island 

• Newfoundland & Labrador 

• Yukon 



• Nunavut 

• Northwest Territories 
 
What best describes your location? 
 

• Urban 

• Rural  

• Other:  
 
How many minutes is the travel time each way to your methadone provider? 
 

• 0-30 

• 31-60 

• 61-90 

• 91+ 

• Other:  
 
How do you get to your methadone provider? (Please check all which apply) 
 

 Public Transport Bus 
 Public Transport Train 
 Walk 
 Bike 
 Carpooling with others 
 Driving by self 
 N/A 
 Other:  

 
How long have you been prescribed methadone? 
 

• 1-3 months 

• 4-6 months 

• 7-9 months 

• 10-12 months 

• 1-3 years 

• 4-5 years 

• 6-7 years 



• 8-9 years 

• 10 years + 
 
How often did you go to your methadone provider in-person before the COVID-19 
pandemic? 
 

• Daily 

• 3 X per week 

• 2 X per week 

• Once a week 

• Twice a month 

• Once a month 

• Not applicable 

• Other:  
 
How often did you go to your methadone provider in-person during the peak of 
the COVID-19 pandemic? 
 

• Daily 

• 3 X per week 

• 2 X per week 

• Once a week 

• Twice a month 

• Once a month 

• Not applicable 

• Other:  
 
How many take home/carry doses did you receive before the COVID-19 
pandemic? 
 

• I did not receive take homes 

• Every second day 

• Twice a week pick up 

• Once a week pick up 

• Twice a month pick up 

• Once a month pick up 



• Other:  
 
How many take home/carry doses did you receive during the peak of the COVID-
19 pandemic? 
 

• I did not receive take homes 

• Every second day 

• Twice a week pick up 

• Once a week pick up 

• Twice a month pick up 

• Once a month pick up 

• Other:  
 
Were you required to attend any of the following to access your methadone 
provider before the COVID-19 pandemic? (Please check all that apply) 
 

 Individual Counselling 
 Group Counselling 
 Family Counselling 
 Court Ordered Drug Counselling 
 I was not required to attend any type of counselling 
 Other:  

 
How did you attend required counselling services before the COVID-19 pandemic? 
 

• I was not required to attend any type of counselling 

• In person appointment 

• Telephone appointment (example cell phone) 

• Virtual appointment (example Zoom) 

• Other:  
 
How often during a month did you attend these counselling services before the 
COVID-19 pandemic? 
 
Short Answer Text:  
 
 



How did you attend required counselling services during the COVID-19 pandemic? 
 

• I was not required to attend any type of counselling 

• In person appointment 

• Telephone appointment (example cell phone) 

• Virtual appointment (example Zoom) 

• Other:  
 
How often during a month did you attend these counselling services during the 
COVID-19 pandemic? 
 
Short Answer Text:  
 
Did you participate in mandatory drug screening before the COVID-19 pandemic? 
(Example urine test) 
 

• Yes 

• No 
 
How often were you required to participate in mandatory drug screening before 
the COVID-19 pandemic? (Example urine test) 
 

• Never 

• 1-2 times a month 

• 3-5 times a month 

• 6-7 times a month 

• 8-9 times a month 

• 10-15 times a month 

• 16+ 

• Other:  
 
Did you participate in mandatory drug screen during the COVID-19 pandemic? 
(Example urine test) 
 

• Never 

• 1-2 times a month 

• 3-5 times a month 



• 6-7 times a month 

• 8-9 times a month 

• 10-15 times a month 

• 16+ 

• Other:  
 
Is your methadone provider trying to maintain two meters to ensure social 
distancing during the COVID-19 pandemic? 
 

• Yes 

• No 

• Sometimes 

• Other:  
 
What has your methadone provider done to maintain social distancing between 
people?  
 
Long Answer Text:  
 
 
Is there anything else you would like to tell us about your methadone providers 
practices during the COVID-19 pandemic? 
 
Long Answer Text:  
 
 
If you received increased take home/carry doses during the COVID-19 pandemic, 
how has your economic stability been affected? 
 

• Improved significantly 

• Improved slightly 

• Did not improve 

• Worsened slightly 

• Worsened significantly 

• Does not apply (example did not get take homes) 

• Other:  
 



If you received increased take home/carry doses during the COVID-19 pandemic, 
how has control over your time been affected? 
 

• Improved significantly 

• Improved slightly 

• Did not improve 

• Worsened slightly 

• Worsened significantly 

• Does not apply (example did not get take homes) 

• Other:  
 
During the COVID-19 pandemic have you used non-routine medical services? 
(Example, being treated for an overdose) 
 

• Once 

• Multiple times 

• No 

• No, but wanted to go and did not 

• Does not apply 

• Other:  
 
 
 
If you have the time and feel comfortable, please tell us if there have been any 
other changes in your quality of life during the pandemic such as economic, social, 
spiritual, mental, emotional, physical, or other due to change to clinic or 
pharmacy practices. 
 
Long Answer Text:  
 
 
 
 
 

Thank you for your participation in our survey and have a good day! 
 
 


